
 
       
 
 
 

 
 

Public Auction Results 

September 19, 2014 

ITEM         APN MIN BID WINNING BID         PURCHASER 

1 003-0-073-570 $2,416.00 $2,416.00 TERRY – RYAN MILLER 

4 003-0-113-500 $1,843.00 $2,300.00 CARL ERICSON 

5 003-0-116-440 $1,637.00 $2,000.00 HECTOR ZAMORA 

7 004-0-057-510 $2,287.00 NO BID  

8 021-0-043-030 $21,921.00 $180,000.00 RICK – ELIZABETH PRINZING 

12 033-0-180-120 $45,886.00 $76,000.00 SEAN RASTEGAR 

13 033-0-350-425 $45,397.00 $45,886.00 SEAN RASTEGAR 

15 040-0-051-025 $19,183.00 $112,000.00 DANIEL T HEWSON 

16 040-0-051-035 $7,293.00 $52,000.00 DANIEL T HEWSON 

34 137-0-120-205 $19,401.00 $125,000.00 DANIEL T HEWSON 

68 645-0-091-020 $2,372.00 No bid  

77 645-0-092-040 $3,731.00 $3,731.00 EARL COURTNEY 

78 645-0-092-050 $6,020.00 $6,020.00 EARL COURTNEY 

82 646-0-099-070 $1,540.00 $10,500.00 AARON PUGA 

85 649-0-090-180 $5,195.00 No bid  

86 649-0-090-260 $3,862.00 $21,000.00 CARLOS PUGA 

87 649-0-108-310 $61,075.00 No bid  
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